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Dear Fraser 
 
Further to your request to Herts and West Essex Intergrated Care Board (ICB) under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000), please find below our answers to your questions.   
 
Pre-amble 

According to the NHS 2018 Excellence in Continence Care report, it is estimated that more than 
50% of care home residents have urinary incontinence. People living in care homes are entitled to 
the same access and level of NHS services as those living in their own homes. Care homes and 
commissioners should collaborate with each other to ensure adequate provision and funding of 
products.  

Please, therefore, accept this data request under the Freedom of Information Act as a Freedom of 
Information Request. This request seeks to collect data regarding your Integrated Care Board’s (ICBs) 
continence provision.  

Please note: if the service you offer differs between residential and nursing care homes, please 
clearly address this in your response to the questions below. If prior to ICB formation, the former 
CCGs had different processes and, these have not changed and the ICB has multiple processes 
across the ICB, please make sure this is reflected in your response below. 

 

Questions 

Q1) Continence care is free at the point of access. We are aware former CCGs used to offer either a 
weekly payment to care providers to fund the purchase of continence aids (i.e pads) themselves or 
in some cases free issued continence aids (i.e. pads) to care home residents via the local 
continence service. Please outline the current approach across the ICB for continence provision for 
both residential and nursing care home residents. 

Herts and West Essex ICB (HWEICB) pay a flat rate for continence provision to patients who are eligible for 
Funded Nursing Care (FNC) within Nursing Homes only. A minority of Nursing Homes within the ICB area 

https://www.england.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2018/07/excellence-in-continence-care.pdf


 

Dr Jane Halpin, Chief Executive                  Rt. Hon. Paul Burstow, Chair 

opted out of this arrangement to access contience products directly from the local contience service 
through historical arrangements. If a patient is eligible for full Continuing Healthcare (CHC), any continence 
care will form part of the overall care package. 

 

Q2) If your ICB currently offers a weekly payment, what is the current weekly payment paid to care 
providers by your ICB for continence aids (i.e. pads)?  Please link to where this is documented for 
care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the application and review 
process operated by the ICB. 

In the former CCG areas of Herts Valleys (now South and West Herts) and East and North Herts, this is £5 
per week. In the former CCG area of West Essex, this is £5.75 per week. These arrangments remain 
inplace.  

Q3) If your ICB currently provides free issues products by your local continence service, please 
confirm how many continence aids (i.e. pads) are issued per resident per day, and what determines 
the number of continence aids (i.e. pads) each resident will receive. Please link to where this is 
documented for care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the 
application and review process operated by the ICB. 

The ICB does not hold this information, however the providers may be able to advise please see contact 
details below  

Essex Partnership Unuversity NHS trust  eput.nhs.uk 

Hertfordshire Community Trust www.hct.nhs.uk 

 

Q4) Please provide the appropriate contact details for continence assessments and funding 
decisions/applications. (Please provide a name, title, email address, phone number and address) 

The ICB does not hold this information, however the providers may be able to advise please see contact 
details below  

Essex Partnership Unuversity NHS trust  eput.nhs.uk 

Hertfordshire Community Trust www.hct.nhs.uk 

 

Q5) Please outline your future proposals and timeline for the review of continence care among your 
ICB. 

There are no current plans to review continence care provision. 

 
 
 
Yours sincerley 
 

https://eput.nhs.uk/
https://eput.nhs.uk/
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Freedom of Information Team 
NHS Hertfordshire and West Essex Integrated Care Board 

 
To comply with the Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations (2015), this information is provided to 
you under the Open Government Licence (OGL).  Information on the OGL, together with conditions of use 
and exemptions, can be found here: http://nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-
management/ogl-user-guidance.pdf.   

 
Information on the Reuse of Public Sector Information Regulations (2015) can be found here 
https://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-management/psi--guidance-for-public-sector-
bodies.pdf.   
 
Hertfordshire & West Essex Integrated Care Board operates an internal complaints procedure in relation to 
Freedom of Information.  If you are dissatisfied with our response, you should in the first instance contact 
us for an internal review.  Any such request should be submitted within 20 working days of your receiving 
our response.  We would not normally accept a request for a review later than 20 working days after you 
have received our response.  

  
In the event that you remain dissatisfied, you have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner 
for a determination on whether or not the Integrated Care Board has complied with the requirements of the 
Freedom of Information Act (2000).   

 
The Information Commissioner’s contact details are: 
Information Commissioners Office  
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF. 

 
Further information on your rights under the Freedom of Information Act (2000) is available at 
www.ico.gov.uk. 

http://nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-management/ogl-user-guidance.pdf
http://nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-management/ogl-user-guidance.pdf
https://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-management/psi--guidance-for-public-sector-bodies.pdf
https://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/documents/information-management/psi--guidance-for-public-sector-bodies.pdf
http://www.ico.gov.uk/

