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Dear Mr Rickatson
Freedom of Information Request (FOI-ICB 261)

Thank you for your request dated 21 April 2023 under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
Having reviewed and considered your request, | am able to confirm that under section 1(1) (a) of
the Act, NHS Somerset holds the requested information, in part, and (b), we are providing our
response as follows.

You requested the following information:

Q1) Continence care is free at the point of access. We are aware former CCGs used to offer
either a weekly payment to care providers to fund the purchase of continence aids (i.e
pads) themselves or in some cases free issued continence aids (i.e. pads) to care home
residents via the local continence service. Please outline the current approach across the
ICB for continence provision for both residential and nursing care home residents.

NHS Somerset issue free continence aids to care home residents via the local continence service.

Q2) If your ICB currently offers a weekly payment, what is the current weekly payment paid
to care providers by your ICB for continence aids (i.e. pads)? Please link to where this is
documented for care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the
application and review process operated by the ICB.

Not applicable.

Q3) If your ICB currently provides free issues products by your local continence service,
please confirm how many continence aids (i.e. pads) are issued per resident per day, and
what determines the number of continence aids (i.e. pads) each resident will receive. Please
link to where this is documented for care providers and provide a link to where care
providers can review the application and review process operated by the ICB.

We do not hold information to provide a response to this question. You may wish to contact our
provider Somerset NHS Foundation Trust for this information.

Q4) Please provide the appropriate contact details for continence assessments and funding
decisions/applications. (Please provide a name, title, email address, phone number and
address)

We do not hold information to provide a response to this question. You may wish to contact our
provider Somerset NHS Foundation Trust for this information.
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Q5) Please outline your future proposals and timeline for the review of continence care
among your ICB.

There is currently no plan to review or change the service being offered to individuals in the way
they receive continence products.

Appeal

If you have any further queries, require any clarification, or have any concerns regarding the way
in which your request has been handled and/or to request an internal review, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

If you remain dissatisfied, you can appeal to the Information Commissioner under section 50 of the
Act.

The Information Commissioner’s Office can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Yours sincerely

Jade Renville
Director of Corporate Affairs
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