
 

 

Please contact: Access to Information Team 

Email: MLCSU.FOITeam@nhs.net   

Direct tel: 01782 872648   

 

16 June 2023 

 

Dear Mr Rickaston 

Re: Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Ref no: FOI-3085-SHTW 

Thank you for your request dated 25 April 2023. 

We can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information you requested. 

Please find our response to your questions below: 

1. Continence care is free at the point of access. We are aware former CCGs used to offer 
either a weekly payment to care providers to fund the purchase of continence aids (i.e 
pads) themselves or in some cases free issued continence aids (i.e. pads) to care home 
residents via the local continence service. Please outline the current approach across 
the ICB for continence provision for both residential and nursing care home residents. 

 
For patients eligible for NHS Continuing Healthcare, residential and nursing care 
providers include the cost of continence products within their quote and invoice 
NHS STW as part of the overall fees. The value differs by patient and provider as it 
is based on the products required and frequency of use. It is not possible to 
provide a value as the cost is part of the overall fee charged. 
 
For patients not eligible for NHS Continuing Healthcare NHS Shropshire, Telford 
and Wrekin ICB do not hold the information, you may wish to redirect your request 
to Shropshire Community Health Care NHS Trust as they may hold the information 
you require: 

 
shropcom.foi@nhs.net 
 

 
2. If your ICB currently offers a weekly payment, what is the current weekly payment paid to 

care providers by your ICB for continence aids (i.e. pads)?  Please link to where this is 
documented for care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the 
application and review process operated by the ICB. 
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As explained in question 1, for patients eligible for NHS Continuing Healthcare, the value 
differs by patient and provider and is based on individual need rather than a set rate or 
value. 
 
For patients not eligible for NHS Continuing Healthcare NHS Shropshire, Telford 
and Wrekin ICB do not hold the information, you may wish to redirect your request 
to Shropshire Community Health Care NHS Trust as they may hold the information 
you require: 

 
shropcom.foi@nhs.net 

 
3. If your ICB currently provides free issues products by your local continence service, 

please confirm how many continence aids (i.e. pads) are issued per resident per day, 
and what determines the number of continence aids (i.e. pads) each resident will 
receive. Please link to where this is documented for care providers and provide a link to 
where care providers can review the application and review process operated by the 
ICB. 

 
For patients not eligible for NHS Continuing Healthcare NHS Shropshire, Telford 
and Wrekin ICB do not hold the information, you may wish to redirect your request 
to Shropshire Community Health Care NHS Trust as they may hold the information 
you require: 

 
shropcom.foi@nhs.net 
 

4. Please provide the appropriate contact details for continence assessments and funding 
decisions/applications. (Please provide a name, title, email address, phone number and 
address) 

 
Please see response to question 3. 

 
5. Please outline your future proposals and timeline for the review of continence care 

among your ICB. 
 

NHS Shropshire, Telford and Wrekin ICB can confirm there are no current  future 
proposals for the review of the continence care service. 

 
Right of Appeal 
 
Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response please do 
not hesitate to contact us. If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are entitled to 
request an internal review which should be formally requested in writing and must be within 
two calendar months from the date this response was issued.  
 
To request an internal review 
 
You can request this by contacting the FOI team by email at MLCSU.FOITeam@nhs.net  or 
by post to Jubilee House, Lancashire Business Park, Leyland, PR26 6TR, specifying why 
you require a review.   
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If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a 
decision unless you have exhausted the CCGs FOI complaints procedure. The ICO can be 
contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 
5AF  
www.ico.gov.uk   
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 

 

 

 

http://www.ico.gov.uk/

