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6th July 2023 
 
  
PRIVATE AND CONFIDENTIAL  
Fraser Rickatson 
 
Sent via email to: Frickatson@careengland.org.uk  
  
 
Dear Mr Rickatson, 
 
Freedom of Information Request  
 
Thank you for your email dated the 21st April 2023 addressed to the Leicester, Leicestershire and 
Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) in respect of your request for information under the Freedom 
of Information Act 2000. Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board confirm our 
response below (your request is set out in italics for ease of reference). 
 
1) Continence care is free at the point of access. We are aware former CCGs used to offer either a 
weekly payment to care providers to fund the purchase of continence aids (i.e pads) themselves or in 
some cases free issued continence aids (i.e. pads) to care home residents via the local continence 
service. Please outline the current approach across the ICB for continence provision for both 
residential and nursing care home residents. 
 
Response: The current approach across Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland is that continence 
provisions for both residential and nursing care home residents are funded. £5.80 is given to residents 
on a weekly basis along with Funded Nursing Care (FNC). FNC is a nationally set weekly amount of 
money paid to independent nursing homes to pay for the nurses that they employ – this is to ensure 
that nursing care is “free” at the point of delivery to everyone, no matter where they live. The current 
fixed FNC weekly rate is £219.71. 
 
2) If your ICB currently offers a weekly payment, what is the current weekly payment paid to care 
providers by your ICB for continence aids (i.e. pads)?  Please link to where this is documented for 
care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the application and review 
process operated by the ICB. 
 
Response: The current payment to residential and nursing care home providers is £5.80 per week.  
 
3) If your ICB currently provides free issues products by your local continence service, please confirm 
how many continence aids (i.e. pads) are issued per resident per day, and what determines the 
number of continence aids (i.e. pads) each resident will receive. Please link to where this is 
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documented for care providers and provide a link to where care providers can review the application 
and review process operated by the ICB. 
 
Response: Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) do not hold this 
information. The Continence Service is provided by Leicestershire Partnership NHS Trust (LPT), 
therefore please be advised to redirect this question to LPT via the following: lpt.foi@nhs.net. 
 
4) Please provide the appropriate contact details for continence assessments and funding 
decisions/applications. (Please provide a name, title, email address, phone number and address) 
 
Response: Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) do not hold this 
information. The Continence Service is provided by Leicestershire Partnership NHS Trust (LPT), 
therefore please be advised to redirect this question to LPT via the following: lpt.foi@nhs.net. 
 
5) Please outline your future proposals and timeline for the review of continence care among your ICB. 
 
Response: Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) is not in a position 
to confirm future proposals and timeline for reviewing Continence Services.   
 
Please note that some documents that we provide may be copyrighted to the Leicester, Leicestershire 
and Rutland ICB and, under The Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations 2015, may incur a 
licence agreement and fee should you wish to re-use them. If you do wish to re-use copyrighted 
material, you must ask our specific permission in all cases, which we may or may not give. Should you 
wish to apply for a licence, please write to the Corporate Governance Team at the above address. 
 
If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request, please contact the 
Head of Corporate Governance in writing at the following address:  
 
Head of Corporate Governance  
Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board 
Room G30, Pen Lloyd Building 
County Hall, Glenfield 
Leicester 
LE3 8TB 
 
If you are still not satisfied following this, you can make an appeal to the Information Commissioner 
(ICO) who is the statutory regulator. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have 
exhausted LLR ICB’s Complaints Procedure. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:  
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane  
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
 
T: 0303 123 1113 or 01625 545745 
E: casework@ico.org.uk 
 
Yours sincerely 

 
Corporate Governance Team  
Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland Integrated Care Board (LLR ICB) 
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